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INTERNAL REVIEW - REFERENCE 25-017IR

In your email of 2 June 2025, you requested an internal review under the Freedom of
Information Act 2000 (FOIA) with regard to the response you received from London Legacy
Development Corporation (LLDC) in relation to your information request reference as above.

The internal review is now complete, and the findings and recommendations of the internal
review are as follows:

1.

1.1.

1.2.

1.3.

2.1.

2.2.

Background

The original request (reference 25-017) was received on 17 March 2025 and requested
that LLDC provide the following information under FOIA:

All correspondence between the LLDC and Reading Agricultural Consultants (RAC)
https://www.reading-ag.com / relating to both Pudding Mill Allotments and the land
known as Bridgewater Triangle from the last 12 months.

A response was sent by LLDC to you on 30 May 2025 stating that it does not hold the
information you have requested.

Your subsequent email received on 2 June 2025 requested an internal review as follows:

This is unacceptable. | would like you hold an internal review immediately. This is a
joint venture involving public money.

Internal review
The internal review confirms that LLDC does not hold the information you have requested.

The Bridgewater Triangle development is being delivered by Stratford East London
Partners LLP, a joint venture between LLDC and Ballymore. Stratford East London
Partners LLP is a separate legal entity. Project management for the development is
contracted to Ballymore Development Management Limited, which in turn engages
specialist third-party consultants to support the delivery of the project.
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https://www.reading-ag.com/

If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you may appeal directly to the
Information Commissioner at the address given below. You should do this within two months
of our final decision. There is no charge for making an appeal.

Further information on the Freedom of Information Act 2000 is available from the Information
Commissioner’s Office:

Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

SK9 5AF

Telephone 08456 30 60 60 or 01625 54 57 45

Website www.ico.gov.uk

Yours sincerely

Chief Operating Officer
London Legacy Development Corporation


http://www.ico.gov.uk/



